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It used to be called noncompliance, and the patients themselves referred to as difficult. But regardless of the
terminology, children’s reluctance or failure to commit to prescribed regimens reduces the effectiveness of
treatment, often leading to additional care, higher costs, and serious, even deadly, complications.

Reflecting a single, authoritative voice, the Second Edition of Adherence to Pediatric Medical Regimens
analyzes in comprehensive clinical detail the factors that affect children’s and teens’ commitment to
treatment – from developmental issues to the influence of parents, peers, and others in their orbit – and offers
empirically sound guidelines for encouraging adherence. It cautions against viewing young clients as
miniature grownups or scaling down adult data, advocating instead for a more nuanced understanding of the
population and a collaborative relationship between practitioner and client.

Critical areas of interest to clinicians and researchers in pediatrics are brought into clear focus as the book:

Provides an overview of adherence rates to chronic and acute disease regimens and examines common●

adherence problems in children and adolescents.
Details consequences of nonadherence and correlates of adherence.●

Critiques major adherence theories and their clinical implications.●

Discusses the range of adherence assessment measures.●

Reviews educational, behavioral and other strategies for improving adherence.●

Offers ways to translate research into pediatric medical adherence.●

This updated edition of Adherence to Pediatric Medical Regimens is an essential reference for anyone
concerned with improving health outcomes in young people, especially clinicians, researchers, and graduate
students in psychiatry as well as pediatric, clinical child, and health psychology.
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From reader reviews:

Rosa Crowe:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the name Adherence to
Pediatric Medical Regimens (Issues in Clinical Child Psychology) suitable to you? Typically the book was
written by popular writer in this era. Often the book untitled Adherence to Pediatric Medical Regimens
(Issues in Clinical Child Psychology)is a single of several books which everyone read now. This particular
book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new age
that you ever know ahead of. The author explained their concept in the simple way, so all of people can
easily to understand the core of this e-book. This book will give you a wide range of information about this
world now. So you can see the represented of the world within this book.

Chad Steinberger:

The particular book Adherence to Pediatric Medical Regimens (Issues in Clinical Child Psychology) has a
lot of knowledge on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was authored
by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research prior to write this book. That book very
easy to read you can find the point easily after reading this article book.

Dorothy Cropper:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-book
method, more simple and reachable. This kind of Adherence to Pediatric Medical Regimens (Issues in
Clinical Child Psychology) can give you a lot of pals because by you taking a look at this one book you have
thing that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of
one step for you to get success. This book offer you information that probably your friend doesn't know, by
knowing more than additional make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? We need to have
Adherence to Pediatric Medical Regimens (Issues in Clinical Child Psychology).

Ann Foley:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got students? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And you also know
that little person like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important as well as book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update in relation to something by book. A substantial
number of sorts of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is Adherence to Pediatric Medical
Regimens (Issues in Clinical Child Psychology).
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