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Microwave/RF Applicators and Probes for Material Heating, Sensing, and Plasma Generation, Second
Edition, encompasses the area of high-frequency applicators and probes for material interactions as an
integrated science.

Based on practical experience rather than entirely on theoretical concepts, and emphasizing
phenomenological explanations and well-annotated figures, the book represents one of the most important
resources on the topics of microwave technologies, applications of RF and microwaves in industry (industrial
heating and drying), and microwave engineering.

After covering the basics of field-material interactions, the book reviews and categorizes probes and
applicators, demonstrates their real-world applications, and offers numerically solved examples.

Readers will find valuable design rules and principles of high-frequency applicators and probes for material
processing and sensing applications in this expanded edition.

Presents new information on how the interactions of electromagnetic fields with materials at high●

frequencies have given rise to a vast array of practical applications in industry, science, medicine, and
consumer markets
Thoroughly revised and expanded edition, providing an update on the most recent trends and findings●

Contains many new sections within existing chapters, along with new chapters on applicators for plasmas●

at microwave/RF frequencies
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From reader reviews:

Sarah Davis:

The book Microwave/RF Applicators and Probes: for Material Heating, Sensing, and Plasma Generation
make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable more increase. Book can to
become your best friend when you getting stress or having big problem together with your subject. If you can
make looking at a book Microwave/RF Applicators and Probes: for Material Heating, Sensing, and Plasma
Generation to become your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase
your knowledge about several or all subjects. You can know everything if you like available and read a
publication Microwave/RF Applicators and Probes: for Material Heating, Sensing, and Plasma Generation.
Kinds of book are several. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think
about this reserve?

Jennifer Larson:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, limited story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not hoping Microwave/RF Applicators and
Probes: for Material Heating, Sensing, and Plasma Generation that give your pleasure preference will be
satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the method for
people to know world a great deal better then how they react to the world. It can't be said constantly that
reading behavior only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to become success person.
So , for every you who want to start studying as your good habit, you are able to pick Microwave/RF
Applicators and Probes: for Material Heating, Sensing, and Plasma Generation become your own starter.

Rhonda Silva:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-book
approach, more simple and reachable. This particular Microwave/RF Applicators and Probes: for Material
Heating, Sensing, and Plasma Generation can give you a lot of good friends because by you taking a look at
this one book you have factor that they don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. This
book can be one of a step for you to get success. This reserve offer you information that possibly your friend
doesn't recognize, by knowing more than other make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? We should
have Microwave/RF Applicators and Probes: for Material Heating, Sensing, and Plasma Generation.

Lupe Holloway:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many concern for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people
likes looking at, not only science book and also novel and Microwave/RF Applicators and Probes: for
Material Heating, Sensing, and Plasma Generation or perhaps others sources were given understanding for
you. After you know how the great a book, you feel want to read more and more. Science e-book was created



for teacher or students especially. Those publications are helping them to put their knowledge. In other case,
beside science reserve, any other book likes Microwave/RF Applicators and Probes: for Material Heating,
Sensing, and Plasma Generation to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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