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In late 2006, residents of Sector 31 of Noida, Uttar Pradesh, discovered the remains of a child in the open
drain that bordered the colony. As the nation watched on in horror, the police uncovered the body parts of
fifteen more children in the same location. These grisly killings were found to have been the handiwork of
Surinder Koli, a serial killer who lived in a house nearby.
In Red-Handed: 20 Criminal Cases That Shook India, lawyers Souvik Bhadra and Pingal Khan narrate the
stories behind some of the most sensational criminal cases to have caught the attention of the country in the
last few decades. From the murder of Nitish Katara in a case of ‘honour killing’ to the shooting of Jessica
Lal; from the Harshad Mehta scam to the Best Bakery arson of 2002; and, from the horrifying ‘tandoor’ case,
in which Naina Sahni was killed and then cremated, to the trial and conviction of Sanjay Dutt under TADA,
Red-Handed examines the motives behind these crimes even as it aims to lay bare the inner workings of the
Indian judicial system. Additionally, the authors illuminate the crucial role that the media has come to play in
judicial matters—it shapes public opinion, and often even investigates cases and delivers justice, much
before the judges do.
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From reader reviews:

Crystal Parrish:

Here thing why this specific RED-HANDED: 20 Criminal Cases That Shook India are different and reliable
to be yours. First of all reading a book is good but it depends in the content of it which is the content is as
scrumptious as food or not. RED-HANDED: 20 Criminal Cases That Shook India giving you information
deeper since different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no guide that similar with RED-
HANDED: 20 Criminal Cases That Shook India. It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your
personal eyes about the thing that will happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you.
It is possible to bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your approach home by train. For anyone who
is having difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of RED-HANDED: 20 Criminal Cases
That Shook India in e-book can be your alternate.

Gary Williams:

You may spend your free time you just read this book this guide. This RED-HANDED: 20 Criminal Cases
That Shook India is simple bringing you can read it in the area, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did
not have much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you much
easier to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Robert Lewis:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our know-how for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every
year ended up being exactly added. This book RED-HANDED: 20 Criminal Cases That Shook India was
filled about science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some
people has several feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you
can really feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book that you just
wanted.

Ronald Folk:

As a student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library or
make summary for some book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's soul or real their
pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and can't see colorful
photos on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we know that
on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many ways to
reach Chinese's country. So , this RED-HANDED: 20 Criminal Cases That Shook India can make you sense
more interested to read.
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