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This authoritative study considers all aspects of the European Union's distinctive constitution since its
inception. A unique political animal, the EU has given rise to important constitutional conundrums and
paradoxes that John Erik Fossum and Agustín José Menéndez explore in detail. The authors consider the
process of forging the EU's constitution and the set of fundamental norms that define the institutional
structure, the decision-making procedures, and the foundations of the Union's democratic legitimacy. Their
analysis illuminates the distinctive features of the EU's pluralist constitutional construct but also the
interesting parallels to the Canadian constitutional experience and provides the tools to understand the
Union's development, especially during the Laeken (2001–2005) and Lisbon (2007–2009) processes of
constitutional reform.

The authors' original theory of constitutional synthesis captures the distinctive traits of the European Union
as a polity. It explains why and how the European Communities were established as the first constitutional
union of constitutional states wherein integration would be steered by law, not power politics or imperialism.
Similarly, it presents the European Union as one of the few examples of a polity that has transcended the
paradigm of the nation-state (and perhaps even that of the state). Locating the substance and process of
Lisbon in its proper constitutional context, Fossum and Menéndez explain why this should be seen as a new
beginning of the Union's constitutional season, not its end. Offering the first history of European
constitutional law that is both theoretically informed and normatively grounded, their book will be essential
reading for all readers interested in the process and theory of European integration.
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From reader reviews:

Todd Crain:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the name The Constitution's
Gift: A Constitutional Theory for a Democratic European Union suitable to you? The actual book was
written by famous writer in this era. The book untitled The Constitution's Gift: A Constitutional Theory for a
Democratic European Unionis the one of several books this everyone read now. This book was inspired lots
of people in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new age that you ever know ahead of.
The author explained their plan in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to understand the core of this
publication. This book will give you a great deal of information about this world now. In order to see the
represented of the world with this book.

Bill Kelly:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new info. When
you read a reserve you will get new information because book is one of many ways to share the information
or maybe their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you actually more imaginative. When you
reading through a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story
how the character types do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other individuals.
When you read this The Constitution's Gift: A Constitutional Theory for a Democratic European Union, it is
possible to tells your family, friends and also soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire the others,
make them reading a e-book.

Laurie Cales:

The guide untitled The Constitution's Gift: A Constitutional Theory for a Democratic European Union is the
book that recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to
you. The language that publisher use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer was
did a lot of exploration when write the book, therefore the information that they share for you is absolutely
accurate. You also will get the e-book of The Constitution's Gift: A Constitutional Theory for a Democratic
European Union from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Joyce Francois:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try point that really opposite from that.
A single activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love The Constitution's Gift: A
Constitutional Theory for a Democratic European Union, you can enjoy both. It is good combination right,
you still want to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout folks. What? Still



don't get it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.
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