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Henrietta Levitt was the first person to discover the scientific importance of a star’s brightness—so
why has no one heard of her? Learn all about a female pioneer of astronomy in this picture book
biography with audio.

Henrietta Swan Leavitt was born on July 4, 1868, and she changed the course of astronomy when she was
just twenty-five years old. Henrietta spent years measuring star positions and sizes from photographs taken
by the telescope at the Harvard College Observatory, where she worked. After Henrietta observed that
certain stars had a fixed pattern to their changes, her discovery made it possible for astronomers to measure
greater and greater distances—leading to our present understanding of the vast size of the universe.

An astronomer of her time called Henrietta Leavitt “one of the most important women ever to touch
astronomy,” and another close associate said she had the “best mind at the Harvard Observatory.” Henrietta
Leaveitt's story will inspire young women and aspiring scientists of all kinds and includes additional
information about the solar system and astronomy. This eBook edition also includes audio accompaniment.
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From reader reviews:

Louis Watson:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Sure, you can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a
go walking, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book allowed Look Up!:
Henrietta Leavitt, Pioneering Woman Astronomer? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You know
beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with its
opinion or you have various other opinion?

Melba More:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what you problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy person? If you don't
have spare time to accomplish others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have
spare time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They must answer that question since
just their can do which. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is correct.
Because start from on pre-school until university need this kind of Look Up!: Henrietta Leavitt, Pioneering
Woman Astronomer to read.

Charlene Stidham:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not need people to be aware of each data they get. How many people to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Examining a book
can help persons out of this uncertainty Information especially this Look Up!: Henrietta Leavitt, Pioneering
Woman Astronomer book since this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the
knowledge in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Thomas Williamson:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen have to have book to know the up-date information of year for you to year. As we know
those guides have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the
world. By book Look Up!: Henrietta Leavitt, Pioneering Woman Astronomer we can get more advantage.
Don't you to be creative people? To become creative person must want to read a book. Just simply choose
the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life by this book Look Up!:
Henrietta Leavitt, Pioneering Woman Astronomer. You can more desirable than now.
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