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Amber has a crush on her boss, Bradley, the wealthy son of a family who owns an oil company. He seems so
far above her and they haven't even spoken once, but for Amber it was love at first sight. One day there's an
emergency and Bradley asks Amber to drive him to the hospital. His grandmother, the chairman of the
board, is in critical condition. Amber waits for him in the hospital corridor, and when he emerges from the
ICU his face is pale, and he asks her, "For my grandmother's sake, will you be my fiancée?"
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From reader reviews:

Ruth Barnett:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like looking
for your favorite reserve and reading a book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you can add
your knowledge by the reserve entitled Make-Believe Bride (Harlequin comics). Try to the actual book
Make-Believe Bride (Harlequin comics) as your pal. It means that it can being your friend when you
experience alone and beside those of course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned for
you personally. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know anything by the book. So
, we should make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Stacey Ryan:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important normally. The book Make-Believe Bride (Harlequin comics) ended
up being making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It
doesn't matter what advantages for you. The book Make-Believe Bride (Harlequin comics) is not only giving
you more new information but also to get your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your
current spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship together with the book Make-Believe Bride
(Harlequin comics). You never truly feel lose out for everything if you read some books.

Richard Hund:

Beside this specific Make-Believe Bride (Harlequin comics) in your phone, it could give you a way to get
more close to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is
fresh in the oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow small town. It
is good thing to have Make-Believe Bride (Harlequin comics) because this book offers to you personally
readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you rarely get what it's interesting features of. Oh
come on, that wil happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, like
treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss it? Find this book in addition to read it from at this
point!

Darlene Kidd:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book had been rare? Why so
many problem for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes
reading through, not only science book but additionally novel and Make-Believe Bride (Harlequin comics) or
maybe others sources were given information for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you
feel desire to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or even students especially. Those
guides are helping them to bring their knowledge. In additional case, beside science publication, any other
book likes Make-Believe Bride (Harlequin comics) to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types
of book like this.
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