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While a number of introductory books on basic and molecular biology are available, none highlight the
foodborne parasitic pathogens. Until now. A state-of-the-art review, Biology of Foodborne Parasites charts
significant progress and outlines key biological techniques applied to foodborne parasitic pathogens research.
The book covers basic biology, genetics and genomics, epidemiology, pathogenesis, diagnosis, control, and
prevention. It showcases recent research that can then be used to spark further breakthroughs.

The book addresses challenging issues in food pathogen detection. It details individual foodborne protists
and helminthes, with each chapter following a similar format for a consistent presentation of information.
It discusses topics ranging from basic biology, genetics and genomics, molecular detection and typing, and
pathogenesis to epidemiology, molecular epidemiology, treatment and prevention, among other current
concerns. It also details the methods used to diagnose the infection, characterize the pathogen, and detect
parasites in three food commodities: meats, water, and fresh produce.

With chapters written by experts in their respective fields, the book presents a reliable roadmap for future
development of improved, innovative biological and molecular methods for analysis of foodborne parasitic
pathogens. A handy, comprehensive reference on all aspects of biology of foodborne parasites, it highlights
research needs and directions, helping you develop advanced diagnostic tools and new intervention
measures.
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From reader reviews:

Wendy Clark:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive today, people have do
something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. That's
why, by reading a book your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand up than other is high. To
suit your needs who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this Biology of Foodborne
Parasites (Food Microbiology) book as starter and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is
usually more than just a book.

Kristine Toomey:

Often the book Biology of Foodborne Parasites (Food Microbiology) will bring someone to the new
experience of reading any book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. In the event you try to
find new book to read, this book very suitable to you. The book Biology of Foodborne Parasites (Food
Microbiology) is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from your official web site,
so you can more easily to read the book.

John Pace:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them friends and family or
their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or even playing
video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity here is look different you can read any
book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the whole day to reading a
publication. The book Biology of Foodborne Parasites (Food Microbiology) it is rather good to read. There
are a lot of people who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. If you did
not have enough space to create this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to
read this book through your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book offers high quality.

Mary Bessler:

The book untitled Biology of Foodborne Parasites (Food Microbiology) contain a lot of information on that.
The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy method. The language is very straightforward all the
people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was authored by famous author. The
author gives you in the new period of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can continue
reading your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation
you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice
examine.
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