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Uncover the Useful Interactions of Fixed Point Theory with Topological Structures

Nonlinear Functional Analysis in Banach Spaces and Banach Algebras: Fixed Point Theory under
Weak Topology for Nonlinear Operators and Block Operator Matrices with Applications is the first
book to tackle the topological fixed point theory for block operator matrices with nonlinear entries in Banach
spaces and Banach algebras. The book provides researchers and graduate students with a unified survey of
the fundamental principles of fixed point theory in Banach spaces and algebras.

The authors present several extensions of Schauder’s and Krasnosel’skii’s fixed point theorems to the class
of weakly compact operators acting on Banach spaces and algebras, particularly on spaces satisfying the
Dunford–Pettis property. They also address under which conditions a 2×2 block operator matrix with single-
and multi-valued nonlinear entries will have a fixed point.

In addition, the book describes applications of fixed point theory to a wide range of diverse equations,
including transport equations arising in the kinetic theory of gas, stationary nonlinear biological models,
two-dimensional boundary-value problems arising in growing cell populations, and functional systems of
integral equations. The book focuses on fixed point results under the weak topology since these problems
involve the loss of compactness of mappings and/or the missing geometric and topological structure of their
underlying domain.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Torres:

The book Nonlinear Functional Analysis in Banach Spaces and Banach Algebras: Fixed Point Theory under
Weak Topology for Nonlinear Operators and Block Operator Matrices ... and Research Notes in
Mathematics) make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable considerably
more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting pressure or having big problem with
your subject. If you can make reading through a book Nonlinear Functional Analysis in Banach Spaces and
Banach Algebras: Fixed Point Theory under Weak Topology for Nonlinear Operators and Block Operator
Matrices ... and Research Notes in Mathematics) to get your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like
add your current capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You could know everything if
you like available and read a reserve Nonlinear Functional Analysis in Banach Spaces and Banach Algebras:
Fixed Point Theory under Weak Topology for Nonlinear Operators and Block Operator Matrices ... and
Research Notes in Mathematics). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science publication or
encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this publication?

Mattie Martin:

This book untitled Nonlinear Functional Analysis in Banach Spaces and Banach Algebras: Fixed Point
Theory under Weak Topology for Nonlinear Operators and Block Operator Matrices ... and Research Notes
in Mathematics) to be one of several books which best seller in this year, that's because when you read this
guide you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book store or you
can order it via online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this
book, because you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason for you to past this e-book
from your list.

Joseph Lewis:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you may
have it in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This kind of Nonlinear Functional Analysis in Banach
Spaces and Banach Algebras: Fixed Point Theory under Weak Topology for Nonlinear Operators and Block
Operator Matrices ... and Research Notes in Mathematics) can give you a lot of pals because by you looking
at this one book you have thing that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. That
book can be one of one step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that probably your
friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than various other make you to be great individuals. So , why
hesitate? We should have Nonlinear Functional Analysis in Banach Spaces and Banach Algebras: Fixed
Point Theory under Weak Topology for Nonlinear Operators and Block Operator Matrices ... and Research
Notes in Mathematics).



George Hoffman:

Some individuals said that they feel weary when they reading a book. They are directly felt the item when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose often the book Nonlinear Functional Analysis in Banach
Spaces and Banach Algebras: Fixed Point Theory under Weak Topology for Nonlinear Operators and Block
Operator Matrices ... and Research Notes in Mathematics) to make your own reading is interesting. Your
skill of reading proficiency is developing when you including reading. Try to choose simple book to make
you enjoy you just read it and mingle the feeling about book and studying especially. It is to be initial
opinion for you to like to start a book and learn it. Beside that the book Nonlinear Functional Analysis in
Banach Spaces and Banach Algebras: Fixed Point Theory under Weak Topology for Nonlinear Operators
and Block Operator Matrices ... and Research Notes in Mathematics) can to be your new friend when you're
experience alone and confuse with what must you're doing of this time.
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