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This true story of the Bai Family in China traces how their devotion to truth placed them on a collision
course with the Communist Party. When they became practitioners of Falun Gong, it paved the way for a
painful and torturous, yet enlightening, path in life, especially for the two brilliant brothers Xiaojun and
Shaohua. After the Chinese Communist regime began its systematic repression of Falun Gong practitioners
in 1999, Bai Xiaojun was tortured to death in one of the laogai or "re-education through labour" camps. His
brother Bai Shaohua also disappeared in another such prison for three years. Through blood and sweat,
Shaohua made it alive out of prison but was once again abducted in early February, 2008.

The details in this gripping account of how Falun Gong practitioners are being repressed reveal the larger
pattern of life, and death, under a totalitarian regime.

Authors Long Tu and Yuan Meng, now living in Canada, compiled this account through personal contact
with members of the Bai Family. They also write from personal experience. Long Tu is a computer program
designer and Yuan Meng an architect and urban designer. Yuan Meng was herself imprisoned for 16 months
in a laogai camp before leaving China, where unusual "meals" caused her body to swell and her back bones
were broken during the persecution. They now live in Toronto and wrote Pagoda of Light to honour their
imprisoned friends, noting that "the experience of the Bai family is but one of thousands of examples."
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From reader reviews:

Norman Brown:

Book is written, printed, or created for everything. You can learn everything you want by a book. Book has a
different type. As we know that book is important point to bring us around the world. Beside that you can
your reading talent was fluently. A guide Pagoda of Light: A Falun Gong Story from Today's China will
make you to be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about every thing. But
some of you think which open or reading a new book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they are
often thought like that? Have you in search of best book or suited book with you?

Jeffery Harman:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try point that really opposite from
that. One particular activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you have been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Pagoda of Light: A Falun Gong Story from
Today's China, you could enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of
hangout type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its called
reading friends.

Rosalind Bowlin:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't ascertain book by its deal with may
doesn't work here is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as
in the outside look likes. Maybe you answer is usually Pagoda of Light: A Falun Gong Story from Today's
China why because the great cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint anyone.
The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly
assist you to pick up this book.

Robert Burmeister:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information easier to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The particular book
that recommended to your account is Pagoda of Light: A Falun Gong Story from Today's China this guide
consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented how
do the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. The
particular writer made some research when he makes this book. Here is why this book suited all of you.
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