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During the Golden Age of Sports in the 1920s, Walter Hagen was to golf what Babe Ruth was to baseball.
The first professional golfer to make his living playing the game rather than teaching it, Hagen won eleven
major professional tournaments over his long career -- two U.S. Opens, four British Opens, and five PGA
Championships (including an amazing streak of four consecutive PGA wins) -- a record surpassed only by
Jack Nicklaus. Hagen was also influential in helping to found the Ryder Cup and was the first American
golfer to top $1 million in career earnings -- a figure equivalent to over $40 million today.

Award-winning sportswriter Tom Clavin has penned a thrilling biography that vividly recalls Hagen's
dazzling achievements and the qualities that made him a star. Energetic, witty, and one of the best putters
ever to walk the green, Hagen was a man who loved to party, was extraordinarily generous to his friends, and
golfed the world over, giving exhibitions. He preferred to travel by limousine, and if he intended to stay
awhile he'd bring a second limo just to transport his clothes, which were nothing but the finest. On his many
trips across the Atlantic to compete in the Ryder Cup or British Open, Hagen was known to throw parties
that lasted days, ending only when the ship reached the shore. He was also the first professional golfer to
admit to playing not only for the love of the game, but also for the love of the winner's purse.

Walter Hagen, forerunner of today's sports superstars, is as dynamic a character as can be found in American
sports history. Bringing Hagen to life with incredible detail and countless anecdotes, Sir Walter is the
authoritative biography of the man who helped create professional golf as it's known today.
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From reader reviews:

Peggy Ross:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to
take a stroll, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book entitled Sir Walter: Walter
Hagen and the Invention of Professional Golf? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You recognize beside
you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with it
is opinion or you have some other opinion?

Nathan Barnes:

What do you consider book? It is just for students since they are still students or the item for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that query above. Every
person has distinct personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pressured someone or
something that they don't would like do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Sir
Walter: Walter Hagen and the Invention of Professional Golf. All type of book can you see on many
resources. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Crystal Parrish:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as compared
to can satisfy your limited time to read it because all this time you only find book that need more time to be
study. Sir Walter: Walter Hagen and the Invention of Professional Golf can be your answer because it can be
read by you who have those short time problems.

Linda Griffin:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our information for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything you want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This publication Sir Walter: Walter Hagen and the Invention of Professional Golf was
filled concerning science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your research competence.
Some people has several feel when they reading the book. If you know how big good thing about a book,
you can really feel enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you
simply wanted.
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