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Along the coast of Fife, in villages like Culross and Pittenweem, historical markers and pamphlets now
include the fact that some women were executed as witches within these burghs. Still the reality of what
happened the night that Janet Cornfoot was lynched in the harbour is hard to grasp as one sits in the harbour
of Pittenweem watching the fishing boats unload their catch and the pleasure boats rising with the tide. How
could people do this to an old woman? Why was no-one ever brought to justice? And why would anyone
defend such a lynching? The task of the historian is to try to make events in the past come alive and seem
less strange. This is particularly true in the case of the historian dealing with the witch-hunt. The details are
fascinating. Some of the anecdotes are strange. The modern reader finds it hard to imagine illness being
blamed on the malevolence of a beggar woman denied charity. It is difficult to understand the economic
failure of a sea voyage being attributed to the village hag, not bad weather. Witch-hunting was related to
ideas, values, attitudes and political events. It was a complicated process, involving religious and civil
authorities, village tensions and the fears of the elite. The witch-hunt in Scotland also took place at a time
when one of the main agendas was the creation of a righteous or godly society. As a result, religious
authorities had control over aspects of the lives of the people which seem every bit as strange to us today as
might any beliefs about magic or witchcraft. That the witch-hunt in Scotland, and specifically in Fife, should
have happened at this time was not accidental. This book tells the story of what occurred over a period of a
century and a half, and offers some explanation as to why it occurred.
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From reader reviews:

Michelle Dewees:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they're still students or that for all people in
the world, what best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
diverse personality and hobby per other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't want
do that. You must know how great along with important the book Witches of Fife: Witch-hunting in a
Scottish Shire, 1560-1710. All type of book are you able to see on many resources. You can look for the
internet solutions or other social media.

Mindy Simmons:

What do you regarding book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you really
need something to explain what yours problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy individual? If
you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have free
time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They need to answer that question due to the
fact just their can do this. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is correct.
Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this particular Witches of Fife: Witch-hunting
in a Scottish Shire, 1560-1710 to read.

Cynthia Campbell:

The event that you get from Witches of Fife: Witch-hunting in a Scottish Shire, 1560-1710 could be the more
deep you digging the information that hide inside the words the more you get interested in reading it. It
doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but Witches of Fife: Witch-hunting in a Scottish Shire, 1560-
1710 giving you buzz feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in selected way that can be
understood simply by anyone who read it because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This
particular book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go
along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this
Witches of Fife: Witch-hunting in a Scottish Shire, 1560-1710 instantly.

Annis Blank:

This book untitled Witches of Fife: Witch-hunting in a Scottish Shire, 1560-1710 to be one of several books
which best seller in this year, here is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit onto
it. You will easily to buy that book in the book retail store or you can order it through online. The publisher
on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, because you can read this book
in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this e-book from your list.
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