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The book explains Russian contract law in a form understandable to lawyers qualified in other countries,
especially common law countries. The introduction gives a concise overview of the Russian legal system in
general and contract law in particular as well as a brief insight into the history of contract law in Russia.
Then the main concepts of Russian contract law are explained, using the conceptual framework of English
contract law to make them accessible to someone not familiar with the codified Russian system.The book not
only considers the legislation regulating Russian contractual relations but also includes appropriate case law
to show how the legislation is interpreted. The focus is on contract law in Russia as it actually operates,
rather than merely the legislative texts, so that it will be directly relevant to legal practitioners and others
who wish to acquire knowledge of the practical application of an important element of the Russian legal
system, as well as those seeking an insight into the realities of codified law in action. The target readership
therefore includes legal practitioners who have to deal with Russian law, academics and students with an
interest in Russian law, the law of contract and comparative civil law, as well as scholars of comparative
legal systems and Russian area studies.
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From reader reviews:

Homer Simon:

Throughout other case, little people like to read book Contract Law in Russia,. You can choose the best book
if you'd prefer reading a book. Providing we know about how is important some sort of book Contract Law
in Russia,. You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely
right, because from book you can learn everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you may be
known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we can easily open a book
as well as searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel bored stiff to go to
the library. Let's study.

Kristine Toomey:

The book Contract Law in Russia, can give more knowledge and information about everything you want.
Why must we leave the great thing like a book Contract Law in Russia,? Several of you have a different
opinion about publication. But one aim that book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely right. Right
now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you can give for
each other; you can share all of these. Book Contract Law in Russia, has simple shape but the truth is know:
it has great and big function for you. You can search the enormous world by open and read a publication. So
it is very wonderful.

John Rivera:

This book untitled Contract Law in Russia, to be one of several books that best seller in this year, this is
because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this particular
book in the book store or you can order it via online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you quicker to read this book, since you can read this book in your Cell phone. So there is no reason
to your account to past this e-book from your list.

Ryan Strausbaugh:

Reading a book for being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book. When
you go through a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your
knowledge, simply because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend
on what sorts of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your research, you can
read education books, but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this sort of us
novel, comics, and soon. The Contract Law in Russia, will give you a new experience in reading a book.
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