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The era of Big Data as arrived, and most organizations are woefully unprepared. Slowly, many are
discovering that stalwarts like Excel spreadsheets, KPIs, standard reports, and even traditional business
intelligence tools aren't sufficient. These old standbys can't begin to handle today's increasing streams,
volumes, and types of data.

Amidst all of the chaos, though, a new type of organization is emerging.

In The Visual Organization, award-winning author and technology expert Phil Simon looks at how an
increasingly number of organizations are embracing new dataviz tools and, more important, a new mind-set
based upon data discovery and exploration. Simon adroitly shows how Netflix, Autodesk, Twitter, eBay and
other tech heavyweights use powerful data visualization tools to garner fascinating insights into their
businesses. But make no mistake: these companies are hardly alone. Organizations of all types, industries,
sizes are representing their data in new and amazing ways. As a result, they are asking better questions and
making better business decisions.

Rife with real-world examples and case studies, The Visual Organization is a full-color tour-de-force.
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From reader reviews:

Connie Sims:

Book is definitely written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can learn everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important thing to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading ability was fluently. A book The Visual Organization: Data
Visualization, Big Data, and the Quest for Better Decisions (Wiley and SAS Business Series) will make you
to become smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of
you think that open or reading any book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they can be thought
like that? Have you searching for best book or suitable book with you?

Karen Jude:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a guide you will get new information mainly because book is one of numerous ways to share
the information or maybe their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you more imaginative. When you
looking at a book especially fictional book the author will bring someone to imagine the story how the
people do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this
The Visual Organization: Data Visualization, Big Data, and the Quest for Better Decisions (Wiley and SAS
Business Series), you may tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge can
inspire average, make them reading a publication.

John Householder:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book mainly book
entitled The Visual Organization: Data Visualization, Big Data, and the Quest for Better Decisions (Wiley
and SAS Business Series) your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that
maybe unidentified for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a
publication then become one application form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get ahead
of. The The Visual Organization: Data Visualization, Big Data, and the Quest for Better Decisions (Wiley
and SAS Business Series) giving you another experience more than blown away your thoughts but also
giving you useful data for your better life with this era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern here
is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning an activity. Do you
want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Derek McCaleb:

A lot of people said that they feel fed up when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the particular book The Visual Organization: Data
Visualization, Big Data, and the Quest for Better Decisions (Wiley and SAS Business Series) to make your



personal reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading expertise is developing when you similar to
reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the idea about book and
reading especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to start a book and learn it. Beside that the
publication The Visual Organization: Data Visualization, Big Data, and the Quest for Better Decisions
(Wiley and SAS Business Series) can to be your brand-new friend when you're feel alone and confuse using
what must you're doing of their time.
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